
TURF FERTILIZERS, HERBICIDES, FUNGICIDES AND INSECTICIDE
BID # 24-0101   |   JANUARY 31, 2024 at 10:30AM

Item #

2024 FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS                                           
*Please write and alternative product description below bid 
item TOTAL UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 
AMOUNT

FERTILIZER

1 21-0-21 80-100%SRN 200sgn (50lb bag) SOP 360 NO BID NO BID $22.60 $8,136.00 NO BID $19.25 $6,930.00 $19.50 $7,020.00 NO BID $22.39 $8,060.40

Alternate: LESCO 20-0-20M 100% NOS SOP $38.63 $13,906.80

2 17-0-0 with .38% Prodiamine (50lb bag) 580 NO BID NO BID $18.30 $10,614.00 $16.50 $9,570.00 $18.50 $10,730.00 $16.70 $9,686.00

Alternate: 17-0-0 with .38% Prodiamine 580 $16.25 $5,850.00 $14.00 $8,120.00

Alternate: Stonewall 0.37% 13-0-0 $16.28 $9,442.40

Alternate: 12-0-3 .38 Prodamine 50% SRN $18.18 $10,544.40

Alternate: 17-0-0 AM w/ 0.37% Prodiamine (50lb bag) $14.00 $8,120.00

3 25-0-10 100% Poly Coated (120 Day Duration) 200 sgn (50 lb bag) 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.15 $7,245.00 $30.00 $9,000.00 NO BID $23.42 $7,026.00

Alternate: LESCO 20-0-20M  $38.63 $11,589.00

4 17-0-5     (.067 Acelepryn / .167 Dimension) 70 NO BID NO BID $67.57 $4,729.90 $66.25 $4,637.50 $56.90 $3,983.00 $70.48 $4,933.60 $58.80 $4,116.00 $78.90 $5,523.00

Alternate: 24-0-12 100% Meth-Ex 50% Expo $103.87 $7,270.90

Alternate: 32-0-5 95% PCU (.067 Acelepryn / .19 Dimension) $78.90 $5,523.00

FOLIAR FERTILIZER

5 Foltec SG 8-24-8 (3x1 case) 9 $262.00 $2,358.00 $786.00 $2,358.00 NO BID $262.00 $2,358.00 NO BID NO BID $262.00 $2,358.00 NO BID $262.00 $2,358.00

Do Not Want Alternate

6 Foltec SG 16-0-16 (3x1 case) 36 $262.00 $9,432.00 $786.00 $9,432.00 NO BID $262.00 $9,432.00 NO BID NO BID $262.00 $9,432.00 NO BID $262.00 $9,432.00

Do Not Want Alternate

7 Foltec SG 24-0-8 (3x1 case) 15 $262.00 $3,930.00 $786.00 $3,930.00 NO BID $262.00 $3,930.00 NO BID NO BID $262.00 $3,930.00 NO BID $262.00 $3,930.00

Do Not Want Alternate

FUNGICIDE

8 Azoxystrobin Flo (1 Gal) 9 $109.76 $987.84 $148.40 $1,335.60 $165.00 $1,485.00 $194.00 $1,746.00 $142.22 $1,279.98

Alternate: Strobe 2L 9 $149.85 $1,348.65

Alternate: Strobe 2L $212.12 $1,909.08

Alternate: Zoxy 2F $356.00 $3,204.00

Alternate: Artavia 2SC (1 gal) $139.95 $1,259.55

9 Iprodione (2x2.5gal)case 25 $334.14 $8,353.50 $328.85 $8,221.25 $275.00 $6,875.00 $344.00 $8,600.00 $347.50 $8,687.50 $297.83 $7,445.75

Alternate: IPRO 2 (2x2.5gal) case 25 $297.25 $7,431.25

Alternate: LESCO 18 Plus $345.14 $8,628.50

Alternate: FP 238 $425.00 $10,625.00

10 Chlorothalonil Flo (2x2.5gal)case 27 $105.00 $2,835.00 $109.25 $2,949.75 $143.00 $3,861.00 $179.50 $4,846.50 $96.81 $2,613.87

Alternate: Chlorothalonil 720 27 $110.75 $2,990.25

Alternate: LESCO Manicure 6FL $123.16 $3,325.32

Alternate: CLT 720 $230.00 $6,210.00

Alternate: Dornic 720 F (2x25gal) case $140.50 $3,793.50

11 100%K-Phosphite (2x2.5gal)case 30 $92.00 $2,760.00 NO BID NO BID $123.00 $3,690.00

Alternate: Stress Master 0-0-31 $130.00 $3,900.00 $498.00

Alternate: Stressmaster Phite 0-0-31 30 $95.50 $2,865.00

Alternate: K-Phite 7LP $165.14 $4,954.20

Alternate: Gold Standard - $33/acre @ 1oz. Rate ? $498.00

Alternate: Ele Max Phosphite Max 0-0-30 (2x2 5gal) case $187.25 $5,617.50

12 Foursome (1gal) 24 $122.67 $2,944.08 $95.50 $2,292.00 $96.10 $2,306.40 NO BID $112.20 $2,692.80 NO BID $104.60 $2,510.40 $98.00 $2,352.00

Alternate: LESCO Tracker SPF $111.71 $2,681.04

Alternate: Omni Green Pigment (1gal) $104.40 $2,505.60

13 Mefenoxam (2.5 gallon jug) 9 $867.00 $7,803.00 $856.50 $7,708.50 $779.20 $7,012.80 $1,027.71 $9,249.39 $984.50 $8,860.50 NO BID $905.88 $8,152.92

Alternate: Mefenoxam 1 gal jug 23 $295.15 $6,788.45

Alternate: Stergo MX (1gal) 23 $281.00 $6,463.00

14 Banol (2x1gal)case 3 $1,017.02 $3,051.06 $890.00 $2,670.00 $2,457.50 $7,372.50 NO BID NO BID $610.00 $1,830.00

Alternate: Propam Select (2x1 gal) case 3 $598.50 $1,795.50

Alternate: Banol (2.5 gal./cont) $1,228.75 $3,686.25

Alternate: Propam Select (4x1) 1.5 $848.00 $1,272.00

Alternate: Banol (2.5gal) 3 $1,228.75 $3,686.25

15 Propiconazole 14.3 (2x2.5gal) case 6 $264.20 $1,585.20 $258.00 $1,548.00 $283.50 $1,701.00 $245.30 $1,471.80 $333.50 $2,001.00 $290.00 $1,740.00

Alternate: LESCO Spectator Ultra $321.72 $1,930.32

Alternate: PPZ 143 (1gal) 30 $99.00 $2,790.00

Alternate: Gunner 14.3 (1gal) 30 $61.70 $1,851.00
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16 Propiconazole 41.8 (4x1gal) case 12 NO BID $316.00 $3,792.00 $374.00 $4,488.00 $497.00 $5,964.00 $409.20 $4,910.40 $348.00 $4,176.00

Alternate: Propi-Star 12 $211.80 $2,541.60

Alternate: LESCO Spectator T&D (2x2.5gal/cs) 10 $545.20 $5,452.00

Alternate: 2.5 gal jug 20 $284.44 $5,688.80

17 Ethephon  (2x2.5gal) case 7 $216.00 $1,512.00 $117.25 $820.75 $148.14 $1,036.98 $107.50 $752.50 $181.72 $1,272.04 $159.50 $1,116.50 NO BID $149.00 $1,043.00 $135.00 $945.00

Alternate:

18 Tuque (2.5 gal) jug 9 $725.00 $6,525.00 $725.00 $6,525.00 $725.00 $6,525.00 $725.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BID $725.00 $6,525.00 $725.00 $6,525.00

Alternate: TEB 360 (1gal) 45 $85.50 $3,847.50

WETTING AGENT / MISC. PRODUCTS

19 Tricure (2x2.5gal)case 4 $440.00 $1,760.00 NO BID NO BID $420.00 $1,680.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate: Percolate $399.16 $1,596.54

Alternate: Aristocracy (2x2.5gal) case 4 $359.50 $1,438.00

Alternate: Vivax (2x2.5gal) Case 4 $412.50 $1,650.00

20 Basal Oil (12 - 15 gal drum) 10 NO BID $177.00 $1,770.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $216.70 $2,167.00 NO BID $208.67 $2,086.70

Alternate: Impel Red (15gal drum) 10 $227.10 $2,271.00

21 Blazon Blue Dye (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate:Turfmarker Blue Select (4x1gal) case 5 gal $93.80 $117.25

Alternate: Super Signal Blue $308.82 $308.82

Alternate: Spray Indicator (1gal) 5 $35.60 $178.00

22 Liberate non-ionic surfactant (2 x 2.5 gal) 3 NO BID NO BID $195.00 $585.00 NO BID NO BID $96.00 $288.00

Alternate: Brewer 90/10 non- ionic surfactant (2x2.5 gal) 3 $53.00 $159.00

Alternate: Alligare 90 non- ionic surfactant (2x2.5 gal) $66.00 $198.00

Alternate: Alligare 90 non- ionic surfactant (2x2.5 gal) Ad Spray 3 $83.50 $250.50

Alternate: Alligare 90 non- ionic surfactant (2x2.5gal) $96.00 $288.00

23 MSO - Methylated Seed Oil  (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 NO BID $120.00 $120.00 $66.00 $66.00 NO BID $105.00 $105.00

Alternate: Sunwet 1 $78.75 $78.75

Alternate: LESCO MSO (5x1gal) $109.40 $109.40

Alternate: Microyl (1gal) 5 $39.11 $195.55

Alternate: Dyne Amic (2x2.5gal) case 1 $270.00 $270.00

INSECTICIDE

24 Acelepryn (64 oz Jug) 3 $1,137.50 $3,412.50 $1,137.50 $3,412.50 $1,137.50 $3,412.50 $1,137.50 $3,412.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,137.50 $3,412.50 $1,137.50 $3,412.50

Do Not Want Alternate

Alternate: Acelepryn Extra (2.5 Gal Jug) 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

Alternate: Acelepryn Xtra (2.5gal) 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

25 Imidacloprid Flo (1 Gal Jug) 32 $49.38 $1,580.16 $62.60 $2,003.20 $60.80 $1,945.60 $47.30 $1,513.60 $63.00 $2,016.00 $75.00 $2,400.00

Alternate: Imidacloprid 2F 32 $44.95 $1,438.40

Alternate: LESCO Bandit 2F $62.89 $2,012.48

Alternate: Mineiro (1gal) 32 $56.55 $1,809.60

HERBICIDE

26 Dimension 2EW (1/2 Gal Jug) 3 $132.85 $398.55 $122.60 $367.80 NO BID $132.85 $398.55 NO BID $132.85 $398.55 NO BID $132.85 $3,412.50

Alternate: Dimension 2EW (2.5 gal jug) 1 $613.00 $613.00

27 Trimec (2x2.5gal)case 16 NO BID $137.50 $2,200.00 NO BID $140.50 $2,248.00

Alternate: Vessel 2x2.5 gal cs. $171.26 $2,740.16

Alternate: Vessel Herbicide (2x2.5 gal) case 16 $106.25 $1,700.00

Alternate: LESCO Three-Way Selective $120.16 $1,922.56

Alternate: Vessel Trimec 16 $102.20 $1,635.20

Alternate: Vessel $149.86 $2,397.76

Alternate: OnDeck Icon (2x2.5gal) case 8 $175.50 $1,404.00

Alternate: Vessel (2x2.5 gal) Case 16 $152.22 $2,435.52

28 Glyphosate (2.5 Gal Jug) 1 $48.50 $48.50 $46.75 $46.75 $113.00 $113.00 NO BID

Alternate: Roundup Pro Concentrate $64.07 $64.07

Alternate: Ranger Pro 1 $40.38 $40.38

Alternate: LESCO Prosecutor Pro $43.11 $43.11

Alternate Ranger Pro 1 $46.39 $92.78

Alternate: Ranger Pro (2.5gal) 1 $89.00 $89.00

29 Transline (2 x 2.5gal) case 3 NO BID $925.75 $2,777.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,045.00 $3,135.00 NO BID $1,045.00 $3,135.00 $1,030.00 $3,090.00

Alternate:
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30 Round-up Pro Maxx (5 gal/cs) 2 $129.75 $259.50 $181.86 $363.72 $171.00 $342.00 NO BID $176.00 $352.00 NO BID $182.00 $364.00

Alternate: Round-up Pro Maxx (1.67 gal jug 3.34 gal cs.) $135.70 $271.40

Alternate: Round-up Pro Maxx (3x1.67) 2 $181.86 $363.72

Alternate: Round-up Pro Maxx (2x1.67gal) Case 3 $165.00 $495.00

31 EsplAnade EZ (2.5 gal) 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.50 $822.00 NO BID $217.25 $859.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate: Round-up Quik Pro SC Total (2.5 gal) 4 $202.75 $811.00

Alternate: Round-up Quick Pro ( 2.5gal) 4 $224.25 $897.00

32 Garlon 4A Generic Tahoe (2x2.5 gal) case 1 $554.38 $554.38 $321.00 $321.00 NO BID NO BID $275.00 $275.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate: LESCO Triclopyr 4 Ester $301.60 $301.60

Alternate: Trycera (2x2.5gal) case 1 $445.00 $445.00

33 Prosecutor (5 gal/cs) 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate: LESCO Prosecutor Pro 4 $86.22 $344.88

Alternate: Ranger Pro (2x2.5gal) case 4 $89.00 $356.00

Alternate: Ranger Pro $790.00 $1,580.00

Prosecutor Pro 2 $517.20 $1,034.40

Alternate: Ranger Pro 2 $553.28 $1,106.56

Alternate: Ranger Pro (30gal Drum) 2 $493.50 $987.00

Alternate: Round-up Pro Max $135.70 $1,628.40

Prosecutor Pro 12 $86.22 $1,034.64

Alternate: Ranger Pro 12 $92.78 $1,113.36

Alternate: Ranger Pro (2x2.5gal) case 12 $89.00 $1,068.00

Alternate: Round-up Custom (12x2.5gal) 2 $894.00 $1,788.00

Alternate: Round-up Custom (30gal) drum 2 $852.00 $1,704.00

Alternate: Round-up Custom 12 $149.00 $1,788.00

Alternate: Round-up Custom 12 $169.90 $2,038.80

Alternate: Round-up Custom (2x2.5gal) case 12 $146.50 $1,758.00

38 Milestone (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 $1,790.00 $1,790.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,809.50 $1,809.50 NO BID $1,625.00 $1,625.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

Alternate:

Alternate: Triclopyr 3 $281.26 $2,250.08

Alternate: 3 SL $251.46 $2,011.68

Alternate: Trycera (2x2.5gal) case 8 $445.00 $3,560.00

Alternate: Triclopyr 4 $348.76 $1,743.80

Alternate: Trycera (2x2.5gal) case 5 $445.00 $2,225.00

41 Vastlan  (2 x 2.5 gal) case 3 NO BID $525.00 $1,575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $577.50 $1,732.50 NO BID $510.00 $1,530.00 $568.00 $1,704.00

Alternate:

$321.00 $1,605.00 $301.60 $1,508.00

$258.75

40 Triclopyr 4 (2 x 2.5 gal) case                                                     Ex: 
Garlon, Element, Alligare 5

$930.00

$80.75 $969.00

$465.00

$1,470.00

$124.75 $1,497.00

$735.00

$2,070.00 NO BID39 Triclopyr 3A (2 x 2.5gal) case                                                 Ex: Garlon, 
Element, Alligare 8

37 Glyphosate 54% - Aquatic approved (2 x 2.5 gal) case         Ex: 
Imitator, Rodeo, Alligare 5.4, Aquaneat, Round-up Custom 12 NO BID

36 Glyphosate 54% - Aquatic approved (30 gal) drum                   Ex: 
Imitator, Rodeo, Alligare 5.4, Aquaneat, Round-up Custom 2 NO BID

35 Glyphosate 41% (2 x 2.5 gal) case                                         Ex: Round-
up, Prosecutor, Alligare 4+, Ranger Pro 12

34 Glyphosate 41% (30 gal) drum                                                   Ex: 
Round-up, Prosecutor, Alligare 4+, Ranger Pro 2

$1,518.00

$861.00 $1,722.00 NO BID $759.00

$990.00

$89.40 $1,072.80 $93.50 $1,122.00

$492.00 $984.00 $495.00

$1,936.00

NO BID NO BID $275.00 $1,375.00

$298.50 $2,388.00 $242.00

$1,518.00

$145.50 $1,746.00 $126.50

$1,120.00

$225.00 $2,700.00 $92.00 $1,104.00

NO BID $560.00

$2,816.00

NO BID $150.00 $1,800.00

NO BID $1,408.00

$2,200.00

NO BID $320.00 $1,600.00

NO BID $275.00
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