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FERTILIZER
1 21-0-21 70-100%SRN 220 sgn (50lb bag) SOP 230 $19.94 $4,586.20 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $18.50 $4,255.00 No Bid -
2 17-0-0 with .38% Prodiamine 220 sgn (50lb bag) 570 $17.50 $9,975.00 No Bid - No Bid - $15.85 $9,034.50

Alternate: 18-0-0 with .38% Barricade 570 $17.90 $10,203.00

Alternate: 19-0-0 .38 Prodiamine 570 $18.90 $10,773.00
Alternate: 13-0-2 .37 Prodiamine 570 $16.45 $9,376.50

3 25-0-10 100% Poly Coated (120 Day Duration) 220 sgn (50 lb bag) 205 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $28.50 $5,842.50 No Bid -
Alternate:29-0-6 EPEC 120 205 $24.38 $4,997.90

4 17-0-5  (.067 Acelepryn / .167 Dimension)  220 sgn 54 No Bid - $65.75 $3,550.50 No Bid - No Bid - $70.93 $3,830.22 $64.75 $3,496.50
Alternate: 30-0-10 .058 ACE .15DIM EPEC 120 54 $73.95 $3,993.30

FERTILIZER TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $14,789.20 N/A $19,764.20 N/A $13,525.50 N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $23,304.22 N/A $12,531.00

FOLIAR FERTILIZER
5 Foltec SG 8-24-8 (3x1 case) 8 $262.00 $2,096.00 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $262.00 $2,096.00 No Bid - $262.00 $2,096.00
6 Foltec SG 16-0-16 (3x1 case) 50 $262.00 $13,100.00 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $262.00 $13,100.00 No Bid - $262.00 $13,100.00
7 Foltec SG 24-0-8 (3x1 case) 9 $262.00 $2,358.00 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $262.00 $2,358.00 No Bid - $262.00 $2,358.00

FOLIAR FERTILIZER TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $17,554.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $17,554.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $17,554.00

FUNGICIDE
8 Azoxystrobin Flo (1 Gal) 20 $235.29 $4,705.80 $83.43 $1,668.60 No Bid - $86.40 $1,728.00

Alternate: 20XY 2F 20 $168.05 $3,361.00
Alternate: Artavia (1 gal) 20 $135.30 $2,706.00
Alternate: Azoxystar, Albaugh 20 $74.98 $1,499.60

9 Iprodione (2x2.5gal)case 30 $286.51 $8,595.30 $284.48 $8,534.40 No Bid - $300.00 $9,000.00
Alternate: IP 238 2.5 gal 60 $207.08 $12,424.80
Alternate: Chipco 26019 (2 x 2.5) 30 $312.50 $9,375.00
Alternate: Iprodione 2F Select, Albaugh 30 $349.90 $10,497.00

10 Chlorothalonil Flo (2x2.5gal)case 30 $147.06 $4,411.80 No Bid - $128.00 $3,840.00 No Bid - $143.50 $4,305.00
Alternate: CLT 720 FL 2.5 gal 60 $103.73 $6,223.80
Alternate: Dornic  (2x2.5) 30 $158.00 $4,740.00

11 100%K-Phosphite (2x2.5gal)case 30 No Bid - $84.15 $2,524.50 No Bid - $94.00 $2,820.00
Alternate: Stressmaster Phite (2x2.5 gal case) 30 $120.98 $3,629.40
Alternate: Gold Standard 1oz/1,000 2.5 gal 1 $249.00 $249.00
Alternate: Ele-Max 0-0-26 (2x2.5) 30 $140.00 $4,200.00

12 Foursome (1gal) 30 $115.00 $3,450.00 $102.70 $3,081.00 No Bid - $105.22 $3,156.60
Alternate: Optimizer Green Shade 30 $112.00 $3,360.00
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Alternate: Envy, Aquatrols 30 $94.98 $2,849.40
Alternate: Envy - Precision Labs, Inc 30 $84.00 $2,520.00

13 Mefenoxam (1 gallon jug) 6 $742.59 $4,455.54 $414.83 $2,488.98 $348.25 $2,089.50 No Bid - $336.00 $2,016.00
Alternate: Stergo  (1gal) 6 $275.70 $1,654.00
Alternate: Mefenoxam 2 AQ, Quali-Pro 6 $369.12 $2,214.72
Alternate: Oxem 4ME 6 $294.00 $1,764.00

14 Banol (1 Gallon Jug) 5 $312.50 $1,562.50 No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Propam (Albaugh) 1 gal 5 $432.35 $2,161.75
Alternate: Banol (2.5 gal jug) 2 $1,305.00 $2,610.00
Alternate: Propam Select - Albaugh 5 $206.00 $1,030.00
Alternate: Propam Select 5 $188.00 $940.00

15 Propiconazole 14.3 (2x2.5gal) case 4 $232.35 $929.40 $260.00 $1,040.00 $275.55 $1,102.20 $238.00 $952.00 No Bid - $233.50 $934.00
Alternate: PPZ 143 2.5 gal 8 $153.39 $1,227.12

16 Propiconazole 41.8 (4x1gal) case 6 $250.00 $1,500.00 $255.00 $1,530.00 $224.00 $1,344.00
Alternate: PPZ 41.8 2.5 gal 10 $208.68 $2,086.80
Alternate: Slant EC (2x2.5) 5 $215.00 $1,075.00
Alternate: PPZ 41.8 Select, Albaugh 6 $299.92 $1,799.52

17 Fluazinam (1 gal) jug 6 $200.00 $1,200.00 $205.00 $1,230.00 No Bid - $213.40 $1,280.40
Alternate: Rotator 6 $335.00 $2,010.00
Alternate: Detour 4SC (2.5 gal) 3 $661.00 $1,983.00
Alternate: Fluazinam 40 SC Select, Albaugh 6 $220.19 $1,321.14

18 Velista (22oz) bottle 22 $297.00 $6,534.00 No Bid - $297.00 $6,534.00 No Bid - $297.00 $6,534.00 No Bid - $297.00 $6,534.00
19 Posterity Forte (1 gal) jug 3 $852.00 $2,556.00 No Bid - $852.00 $2,556.00 No Bid - $852.00 $2,556.00 No Bid - $852.00 $2,556.00
20 Densicor (51oz) bottle 6 $702.80 $4,216.80 $702.80 $4,216.80 $681.72 $4,090.32 No Bid - No Bid - $681.72 $4,090.32

Alternate: Prothio 4L 64 oz. = 7.5A 5 $600.00 $3,000.00
Alternate: Prothioconazole 4L Slect (64oz. Btl)-Albaugh 6 $660.00 $3,960.00
Alternate: Prothioconazole 41% 6 $650.00 $3,900.00

FUNGICIDE TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $48,345.79 N/A $42,210.80 N/A $45,644.32 N/A $21,283.58 N/A $35,009.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $46,368.32

PLANT GROWTH REGULATOR
21 Legacy (1 gal) jug 4 $1,320.80 $5,283.20 $380.00 $3,040.00 $1,320.80 $5,283.20 No Bid - $485.00 $1,940.00

Alternate: Legacy (2.5 gal) jug 4 $1,320.80 $5,283.20
Alternate: Sea Pro 2.5 gal jug 2 $1,328.80 $2,657.50

22 Primo (1 gal) jug 4 $320.00 $1,280.00 $320.00 $1,280.00 $320.00 $1,280.00 No Bid -
Alternate: T-Nex (Quali-Pro) 1 gal 4 $227.58 $910.32
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Alternate: PUR 113 4 $117.21 $468.84
Alternate: Pramaxis MEC (1gal) 4 $96.50 $386.00
Alternate: Trin-Pac, Albaugh 2.5 gal jug 2 $273.08 $546.15
Alternate: Trin-Pac 11.3% 4 $101.60 $406.40

PLANT GROWTH REGULATOR TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $7,473.52 N/A $5,752.04 N/A $4,706.00 N/A $3,203.65 N/A $6,563.20 N/A $0.00 N/A $2,346.40

WETTING AGENT / MISC. PRODUCTS
23 Tricure AD 5 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $91.65/gal $458.25

Alternate: Tricure AD (2.5) 5 $204.57 $1,022.85
Alternate: Infiltrip 2.5 gal 5 $157.38 $786.90
Alternate:Aristocracy (2x2.5) 1 $394.00 $394.00

24 Basal Oil (12 - 15 gal drum) 12 No Bid - No Bid - $225.00 $2,700.00 No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Impel Red (15gal) 12 $276.00 $3,312.00
Alternate: Elite Premier Blue, Red River (12.5 gal jug) 12 $219.37 $2,632.44

25 Blazon Blue Dye (2 x 2.5 gal) case 2 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Blue Spray Dye (1gal) Precision Labs 10 $32.00 $320.00

26 Liberate non-ionic surfactant (2 x 2.5 gal) 4 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $210.00 $840.00
Alternate: Ad-Spray 90 (2x2.5) 4 $90.00 $360.00
Alternate: Alligare 90, Alligare 4 $74.90 $299.60
Alternate: Chemstick (4x1gal) Precision Labs 5 $195.00 $975.00

27 MSO - Methylated Seed Oil  (2 x 2.5 gal) case 2 No Bid - $60.00 $120.00 No Bid - $140.00 $280.00
Alternate: Microyl 1 gal 10 $44.90 $449.00
Alternate: Dyne-Amic (2x2.5) 2 $251.50 $503.00
Alternate: Sunset, Red River 2 $80.80 $161.60

WETTING AGENT / MISC. PRODUCTS TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $1,022.85 N/A $1,235.90 N/A $4,569.00 N/A $3,093.64 N/A $4,115.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $1,578.25

INSECTICIDE
28 Acelepryn Xtra (2.5 Gallon Jug) 6 $1,545.00 $9,270.00 $1,390.00 $8,340.00 $1,545.00 $9,270.00 No Bid - $1,390.00 $8,340.00

Alternate: Balata 32 oz 6.5oz/A 26 $675.00 $17,550.00
Alternate: Diamid, Albaugh (1 qt) 60 $675.00 $40,500.00

INSECTICIDE TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $9,270.00 N/A $17,550.00 N/A $8,340.00 N/A $40,500.00 N/A $9,270.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $8,340.00

HERBICIDE
29 Dimension 2 EW (1/2 gal) 2 $139.50 $279.00 $139.50 $279.00 $139.50 $279.00 No Bid - No Bid - $139.50 $279.00

Alternate: Dimension 2EW, Corteva 2 $139.50 $279.00
30 Vessel (2 x 2.5 gal) case 16 $116.94 $1,871.04 $131.00 $2,096.00 No Bid - $103.95 $1,663.20

Alternate: Threesome 2.5 gal 32 $73.06 $2,337.92
Alternate: Trimec 992 (2x2.5) 16 $122.00 $1,952.00
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Alternate: On Deck Icon (2x2.5) 8 $245.00 $1,960.00
Alternate: Trimec 992, PBI Gordon 16 $119.90 $1,918.40

31 Transline (2 x 2.5gal) case 3 No Bid - No Bid - $716.00 $2,148.00 $850.00 $2,550.00 No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Sonora, Alligare 3 $693.65 $2,080.95

32 Garlon 4A Generic Tahoe (2x2.5 gal) case 1 No Bid - $448.65 $448.65 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Boulder 2.5 gal 2 $243.00 $486.00
Alternate: Trycera (2x2.5) 1 $436.50 $436.50

33 Prosecutor (5 gal/cs) 8 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Ranger Pro (2x2.5) 8 $87.00 $696.00
Alternate: Ranger Pro, Bayer 8 $99.90 $799.20

34 Glyphosate 41% (30 gal) drum                                                   2 $499.00 $998.00 No Bid - $507.30 $1,014.60
Alternate: Ranger Pro 2 $530.00 $1,060.00
Alternate: Ranger Pro 2 $571.80 $1,143.60
Alternate: Ranger Pro (30gal) drum 2 $502.50 $1,005.00
Alternate: Ranger Pro, Bayer 2 $569.40 $1,138.80

35 Glyphosate 41% (2 x 2.5 gal) case                                     12 $92.00 $1,104.00 No Bid - $90.25 $1,083.00
Alternate: Ranger Pro 12 $91.80 $1,101.60
Alternate: Ranger Pro 2.5 gal 24 $49.84 $1,196.16
Alternate: Ranger Pro (2x2.5) 12 $87.00 $1,044.00
Alternate: Ranger Pro, Bayer 12 $99.90 $1,198.80

36 Glyphosate 54% - Aquatic approved (30 gal) drum                  1 No Bid - $883.00 $883.00 No Bid - $859.50 $859.50
Alternate: Bayer Aquamaster 1 $855.00 $855.00
Alternate: Aquamaster (30gal) drum 1 $810.00 $810.00
Alternate: Aquamaster, Bayer 1 $801.90 $801.90

37 Glyphosate 54% - Aquatic approved (2 x 2.5 gal) case                     6 $146.55 $879.30 $192.00 $1,152.00 No Bid - $146.90 $881.40
Alternate: Roundup Custom 2.5 gal 12 $78.80 $945.60
Alternate: Aquamaster (2x2.5) 6 $139.00 $834.00
Alternate: Aquamaster, Bayer 6 $137.10 $822.60

38 Milestone (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 No Bid - No Bid - $1,625.00 $1,625.00 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Whetstone, Allicage 1 $1,325.00 $1,325.00

39 Triclopyr 3A (2 x 2.5gal) case                                                             8 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Triclopyr 3, Alligare 8 $233.90 $1,871.20

40 Triclopyr 4 (2 x 2.5 gal) case                                                     7 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - $315.00 $2,205.00 No Bid - $277.00 $1,939.00
Alternate: Triclopyr 4, Alligare 7 $283.50 $1,984.50
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41 Vastlan  (2 x 2.5 gal) case 2 No Bid - No Bid - $525.00 $1,050.00 $560.00 $1,120.00 $590.00 $1,180.00 No Bid - No Bid -
42 Reward (Diquat) (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 $485.00 $485.00 $251.00 $251.00 $485.00 $485.00 No Bid - No Bid -

Alternate: Diquat 1 gal 5 $65.05 $325.25
Alternate: Diquat, Alligare 1 $279.00 $279.00

43 Clethodim 2e (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Grassout Max Qt. 20 $29.48 $589.60
Alternate: Tapout (2x2.5) 1 $448.20 $448.20

44 Krenite (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 No Bid - No Bid - $482.50 $482.50 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Krenite S, Albaugh 1 $850.00 $850.00

45 Confront (2 x 2.5 gal) case 1 $761.00 $761.00 No Bid - No Bid - $692.50 $692.50
Alternate: Confront (4 x 1 gal) case 1 $669.41 $669.41
Alternate: Confront 1 gal 5 $171.56 $857.80
Alternate: 2D (1 gal jug) - Quali-Pro 5 $96.25 $481.25

46 Escort XP (1 pound) 2 No Bid - $89.60 $179.20 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -
Alternate: Southpaw 16oz. 2 $170.40 $340.80
Alternate: MSM 60, Alligare 2 $38.40 $76.80

HERBICIDE TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A $7,200.35 N/A $8,501.73 N/A $15,961.40 N/A $16,918.00 N/A $13,134.25 N/A $0.00 N/A $8,412.20


	2026 Bid Tab 

